
 

ENE 99s Monthly Meeting  
 

Norwood Airport (KOWD) 
 

Flight Level Aviation 
125 Access Rd., Norwood, MA 

 
Feb 8, 2025 10:00 AM  

  

Join us on Saturday, February 8, as we prepare for an exciting Spring 
lineup of events. After the meeting, we will enjoy lunch on the airport at 
Taso’s Euro Cafe. No need to RSVP; we will get a meal count at the 
meeting. 

 Here’s the Zoom link for the meeting: 

Join Zoom Meeting 
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/82531686945?pwd=9idzmR3aVnUoLi4QivK7oFjja
Ozx0S.1 
 
Meeting ID: 825 3168 6945 
Passcode: 99 

  

https://womenpilotsene.us6.list-manage.com/track/click?u=8f1693d56698349f3356ded0c&id=031d49f77e&e=75347ca4ae
https://womenpilotsene.us6.list-manage.com/track/click?u=8f1693d56698349f3356ded0c&id=031d49f77e&e=75347ca4ae


 

Here is a link to the draft of the minutes from the January Chapter 
meeting. Please review and note any corrections before the February 



meeting. 
https://mcusercontent.com/8f1693d56698349f3356ded0c/files/c4bda33e-
293e-5055-c544-
c178a63d28a7/ENE_99s_Draft_Minutes_January_13_2025.pdf 
  

  

✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈  

Congratulations 

to Holly Intravia for soloing in December, to Kelly Keane for completing 
the Professional Pilot Leadership Program, and to Julia Lindow for 
passing her written in December. Keep up the great work, ladies! 
  

✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈  

Scholarship Luncheon 
March 8, 2025 

Paparazzi - Wellesley, MA 

Plans are being finalized for our signature event of the year - the 
scholarship luncheon, which will be held on 3/8/25 at Paparazzi 
restaurant in Wellesley, MA. Registration will be out shortly. You don’t 
want to miss our speaker, Margie Arnold, Ph.D, who will speak on the 
life and legacy of Amelia Earhart. A limited number of reduced price 
tickets will be offered for student pilots, so register early to grab one of 
these! 

Boosters and Raffle Tickets 

We are selling Program Boosters and Raffle tickets to help defray 
luncheon costs. Anyone can purchase a booster. Send an inspirational 
message to student pilots, advertise a business, remember historical 
figures - there are so many possibilities for Boosters! Many thanks to 
Sue Lin for donating a handmade 99s afghan and Arlene Alexander for 
donating the remainder of the items for the raffle. See the attached 
Booster form and Raffle Flyer to purchase. 

https://womenpilotsene.us6.list-manage.com/track/click?u=8f1693d56698349f3356ded0c&id=37902cb779&e=75347ca4ae
https://womenpilotsene.us6.list-manage.com/track/click?u=8f1693d56698349f3356ded0c&id=37902cb779&e=75347ca4ae
https://womenpilotsene.us6.list-manage.com/track/click?u=8f1693d56698349f3356ded0c&id=37902cb779&e=75347ca4ae


 



 

✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈  



 

✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈  

Chapter Dues - $20 

It’s time to pay chapter dues, which are in addition to International 99s 
membership dues. Dues help us support our chapter operations. See 
our website for more information or to pay electronically. 
  http://womenpilotsene.org/ 
  

✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈  

  

Scholarships 

The 99s offer so many opportunities! Look for a New England Section 
Seaplane scholarship in February. CT Chapter Scholarship applications 
due 3/1; Amelia Earhart First Wings Spring Applications due 4/1. We are 
here to help you apply - please reach out to us! 
  

https://womenpilotsene.us6.list-manage.com/track/click?u=8f1693d56698349f3356ded0c&id=10c5ce74f1&e=75347ca4ae


✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈ ✈  

  

99s Int’l Conference July 9-13, 2025, in Burlington, VT 

 

Plans are well underway for an exciting Ninety-Nines International  
Conference. Register to attend now; early registration ends 3/31.   
https://akatravelteam.swoogo.com/99s2025 

Please volunteer to help out with the conference. We need help with 
finding sponsors and need volunteers for the Hospitality suite - see the 
Section Governor’s Squawk for more information. 

https://womenpilotsene.us6.list-manage.com/track/click?u=8f1693d56698349f3356ded0c&id=e2d84a48a5&e=75347ca4ae

